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According to the required torque value, the
preset determines the torque. 

1.

When predicting the torque, pull the
hexagonal lever at the end of the wrench,
adjust the scale line to the required torque
value, and put the hexagonal key back in
place after adjustment. 

2.

Install a suitable socket on the square tenon of
the wrench and cover the fastener. Slowly
increase the force on the handle, and release
the force when you hear a "click" sound (the
preset torque value has been reached). 

3.

When using a larger torque value, a long
sleeve rod can be added for operation, so as
to save labor. When you hear a "click", you can
remove the force, but be sure to push the
wrench in the opposite direction, so that the
wrench parts can be reset and ready for use.
5. For the torque wrench that is used for the
first time or has not been used for a long time,
it is necessary to operate the torque wrench
5-6 times with medium and high torque first,
so that the wrench components are specially
lubricated. After use, please return the torque
value of the wrench to the minimum value

4.

Using chrome-plated steel pipe shell, high
strength and large torque range

1.

Manufactured according to ISO6789-
2003GB/T15729-2008 standard 

2.

It has a bidirectional ratchet head, and a
differential device is set on the torque scale
of small specifications.

3.

Accuracy: ±4%4.

Product Features

kertz.id

Usage



kertz.id

SPECIFICATION

Model Drive
Torque range

N.m

150-800
200-1000
300-1500
400-2000
1000-3000
2000-4000
3000-6000

Scale value

N.m

1
2.5
5
5
25
50
100

Length

mm

1060
1170
1340
1340
1400
1650
2005

Weight

kg

4.95
5.45
8.7
8.75
14.6
25
41

Accuracy

KTW-800
KTW-1000
KTW-1500
KTW-2000
KTW-3000
KTW-4000
KTW-6000

3/4"
1"
1"
1"
1"

1-1/2"
1-1/2"

4%
4%
4%
4%
4%
4%
4%
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